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Our world is not only arrogant, but retarded. As a collective of humans, humanity
has arrogantly chosen programs of death for its "religion", and it has followed
these very much insistently and fed into them for a long time.

Needless to say, that's the worst survival policy a species can take for itself. Yet
in general because a huge ego can stand in the front of realizing this, a lot of
people will have to first reap catastrophic consequences before they decide to
change their ways.

The rule of the Jews in the West is actually a symptom of collective retardation of
it. There was never any reason for them to rule, upset cultural norms, set us back
in the neolithic age, and nobody should be as insane as to want to have people
in influential positions in a civilization that wants to wipe out said people.

Yet, here we are. That is the power of confusion and foolishness. Everything is in
reverse.

It's also the pinnacle of manifestation when the people do not listen to the Gods.

A year or so earlier in November [before the twilight happened in the markets
and the economy of course] I explained to you about everything that was going to
happen and how it was going to happen exactly in the Co-Vid thing. Before this,
all of us pulled through the Co-Vid situation and actually most of us did
phenomenally well as most people were breaking apart in all levels around us.

Go read the posts if you are a new member here, and educate yourself.

The central points communicated which were stated to be expected were these.
They are all here right now:

1. Economic downturn
2. War that almost escalated numerous times into WW3
3. How it was absolutely retarded but actually fully predictable this would happen
over the flu named "Co-Vid" everyone was flapping about
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4. And how the above won't solve itself until people wake up and how we are
now faced with the agenda of the enemy which has been publicly declared.

Now I open the news and I see things like "10 years recession incoming", "we
were mistaken to do what we did for Coronavirus", "Co-Vid restrictions in China
haven't moved", "Klaus Schwab praises the Chinese Model with Justin Trudeau".

You see the enemy for what they are now, everyone is increasingly seeing this in
all areas of life. We are also being confronted with our retardation.

The time of sleeping and being a retard is over. Do that aura of protection and
these workings as we have indicated, and don't be a fool.

Our community we will protect and will be strong in one another in the face of
these events. Yet you will see many people running around like headless
chickens during this time.

We have to be strong. I did not envision the best times for advancement to be
during such abnormal times, as these times are not constructive, but we all have
the strength we need to move forward, and that is a blessing.

These are our challenges in this time and century. Satan was given a podium to
speak for a few decades, because he had none; He gave us spiritual knowledge
which can help us and sound advice, to all of us.

The so called "Gentiles" have been fools that never gave him one, and discarded
their own Gods. They have a long way to go to become "Gentiles" again, the
people of the Gods that they were. Shock after shock, a portion of them will wake
up.

And let the final portion that does not wake up turn to ash in the fire of its own
ignorance brothers and sisters in Satan, and do not mourn for them.

Now, the golden "once in thousands of years" opportunity is flashing itself, and
you are here. Make it worthwhile.

All of you in this world are going to see that Father Satan never lies. The Gods
are not liars, they are the Truth. If one is properly rectified and has ears to listen,
and has moved beyond the low levels of consciousness, then humanity could
fare better by trying to listen.



We are not listening, "we" as in a human species. Some are not even listening to
the basic advice. The outcome of this is generally what we have related to before
as events that we must at all costs move away from.

The same mistakes are being repeated. Then, everyone thinks the Gods will
eventually come in and bail everyone out, "simply because" of any reason. Yet
this is half the fact; we are expected to do our ends ourselves.

The reality is this love manifests itself in the knowledge and power we are given,
and it rises the more we are advancing upwards rather than do the dictates of the
jew.

As we distance ourselves from the light of the Gods and their advice, we open
ourselves up to the lowest entities of the universe which seek actively to harm us
and are in collaboration with jews.

It's funny how you always have to explain the same things when it comes to
people like me, but every retarded thing in this world is "instantly accepted"
because the masses are that retarded. So I am telling you this fellow SS, do NOT
allow yourself to be in this state.

These people will pay for their accumulated negative energy and jewish
servitude, and they pay for it everyday - ignorance is the heaviest price one has
to pay in this life. When we wake up, you think you have it hard, but you have it a
million times easier.

The manifestation of all these events, is because society is the manifestation of
the current spiritual state of humans. The collective suffers what it will, because
of its level that it has accepted for itself. At this level of cowardice and ignorance,
this is the outcome of it.

The late cowards of every time and era, get to experience this and there is no
exception. There can never be a fake solution out of this, only the rising of better
people and awareness.

We are sitting on a golden opportunity. All of you can have a greater life than this
world or karma has planned, and you can rise higher, even at the face where the
enemy machinates scheme after scheme. Appreciate this.

Lastly, the Joy of Satan and the Gods will not beg people to join them. We will
make our presence known. Satan doesn't buy people over a plate of food.
Humanity must see the Gods by its own Will, or see nothing at all; we have to
wake up in ourselves.



Those who want to sink in the lower level of the abyss will be left to do so. Only
the willing souls can and will be saved.

As far as our own are concerned, do not forget to apply the means you are given
everyday. We are here to make the difference we are all supposed to make and
have been ordained to do by the Gods.

Be blessed and powerful at all times, and do not allow these things to take you
down at all. The Gods are with us.

HAIL SATAN!!!
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