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The first and primary idea and conception that has done most damage of this world, is 
the one that has been promoted by the enemy and jews. Primarily, this idea is the 
foundation of Christianity, Islam and Judaism.  
 
Specifically, what this idea is, is summarized into this phrase: "This World Is Evil".  
 
This perverted ideal, created an array of different mental illnesses in human beings. It 
created denial, lack of care, a sense that man has no reason to really exist.  
 
Ancient mystics and meditation masters, knew that this world was not "all that is", but 
that the world of matter is part of another, larger world that has levels and layers. Human 
beings were perceived as existing both in this world and what we broadly call the astral 
plane.  
 
Thoth's teaching is that 'As above, so below', indicating the bond between the lower and 
higher worlds. Both are aspects of man internally and externally in the same manner. We 
are spirit & we are matter. It's because we are spirit that we are matter, and because we 
are matter that we are too, spirit.  
 
Thoth's Statement here means also that the external world, is in a way, a manifestation 
of our inner world. To condemn the external world, which is the macro-cosmic 
expression of our own internal microcosm, is basically to hate on the human soul and the 
human condition. If we hate the world, then we also hate ourselves - if we want this world 
to be gone, we effectively want ourselves gone from it.  
 
"As Above, So Below". In this manner, Thoth also, alongside our Gods, did share the 
spiritual knowledge, which rectifies our inner microcosm, and manifests through the laws 
of the universe into our outer macrocosm. The limit of this perfection is the limit of our 
very own consciousness. Thoth taught that our level of existence rests in our very own 
hands as humanity. To hate on the external world is to hate on ourselves, it's the below 
of our above.  
 
Modern physics has destroyed the dogma of the dark ages of "Christianity", which was 
based upon the falsified and gross barbaric ideal of the jews, that our world is "gross 
matter" and therefore "evil matter". Even in Ancient books such as those written by any 
mystery schools, none really refer to our world as a "material" world or a "material 
prison", or other lunacy such as the Bible or Quran.  
 
Our world is understood to be a vibrating, sound and light based, living world, and part of 
a general universe, just a denser aspect of it. Modern physics and quantum physics have 
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grasped this ideal, that this world is not really "gross matter", but rather different 
formation of particles, sound waves, patters and in essence, light, which is wave. We are 
part of the light of the universe, and are living in one of its levels.  
 
The ideas that "we only live once" or that "the world is evil", generated ideals of greed, 
destruction, barbarism and above all, a careless attitude towards other beings, our 
actions, and finally our world. We have been lied to not only about the physical, but also 
about the metaphysical.  
 
It's the people that cared about this world, that made anything positive in it. Humanity 
would be nothing but monkeys living in trees were it not for specific people to wake up 
from this situation and start caring about our world.  
 
The metaphysical fruit of this mentally ill ideal of the enemy, is how many people are now 
creating different forms of delusional escapism towards fake "Artificial Intelligence 
Worlds" or "Virtual Reality", with some people literally talking of wanting to live in pods.  
 
These people know nothing of the world, but are ready to embark on the next one - sort 
of how Christian Priests were so fond to go in the afterlife. The new priesthood of decay 
has changed its mask, but its rhetoric remains the same. The heaven of Jesus has now 
become the "Heaven" of AI, or something similar. All of this preys on the basic fears of 
human beings, all based upon the same and primary lie of this world being evil.  
 
It also manifests in how many want to escape this world - because this escapism in the 
first place created our world into a dystopia that one needs to 'escape' from. Increasingly, 
many people are stopping to even care about this world, leaving it to the hands of the 
most corrupted to exist into and manage things for the rest of us.  
 
And these individuals, boastfully declare now, that they want to turn humans into a form 
of living factory fuel, living inside a pod, where they might be fed intravenously from 
"ecofriendly" bug juice jelly, while they are poorly hooked into some fake 3d visual 
stimulation machine. The matrix undertones here should be apparent.  
 
Turning man who was meant to be as the Gods, into a form of fossil-fuel, is what they 
boastfully promote as a plan. One way or another, these beings which are motivated by 
aliens, are constantly telling humanity to "leave" this world, but also, leave their ability to 
become Gods behind. That's their goal and their aim. To keep humanity blind perpetually 
and forever.  
 
Further rising of the state above and the further this weakness progresses itself, so will 
this illness continue spreading: The less involvement of people in this world, the more 
worthless our world is going to become. The more worthless, the more many will 
desperately seek to "Escape it", and the more they seek to "escape it", the more will this 
world become worthless, 
 
The circle of futility does not end by denial, it ends when people spiritually wake up. This 
world deserving of hate, and we are going to be the ones to do it ourselves.  



 
The carelessness of many for one another and this world at large, created by the 
dogmas of the enemy, has progressively ruined humanity by abolishing the sense of 
maturity of responsibility needed for people to contemplate their own actions, to 
meditate, or to build physically and cherish one another and this world.  
 
General denial of science, or the reality in front of us, was also procured by the enemy's 
life hating dogmatic "Religious" ideals. The Jews in particular, while they are the core 
creators of this ideal, excreted this from their culture and merely pushed this into 
Gentiles to cause them a maximum amount of damage. The extent to which this is 
absorbed in a civilization, reassures its collapse.  
 
The strongest people are those who didn't consume this ideal, but the escaping from its 
ramifications was impossible: this virus infestation caused many losses for Gentile 
people, not only physically, but culturally, in the arts, in their soul, and even into our 
quality as species. Jews are busy existing, while Gentiles are busy living in Zuccerborg's 
wanna be "VR" in where they experience nothing in reality.  
 
The severing of the bonds of reality and recognizing the beauty into this world, are 
already forcing people in denial to double on this denial.  
 
The foundation of the above idea, promotes also godlessness and the severing of man 
from his higher spiritual instincts. This happens because man denies himself and his own 
foundation, but also the root of the tree of the human soul, which is the material realm. 
It's upon the material that man exists first, and then grows upwards.  
 
Severing the roots towards reality and what is earthly, we also lost our connection to the 
higher realms. The severing of the connection to the higher levels of existence, was 
severed because the nihilism of a human being without a soul, spreads itself to levels 
that created a general lack of understanding about the importance of life and our world.  
 
Deforestation, destruction of other animals or nature at large, humans treating each 
other like garbage, melting pot our differences instead of maintaining them, the vice of 
blindness and ignorance, all these spread upon humanity based on these diseased 
ideals. "The world does not matter, the world is evil, live for your next life, you only live 
once".  
 
The idea to live for the next life, is a mirror of the idea that you only live once. Both are 
founded and cemented on existential nihilism, denial of existence, and hate of the 
present moment and existence. Either constitute a destructive imbalance, that bleeds 
upon the world.  
 
Our world has been destroyed by the fake spiritualists and the diseased empiricists. In a 
sense, it's the people that spoke  the loudest against this world and its"Evil", that 
procured and created all this evil: the denial this idea created in mankind, destroyed all 
that mankind has been trying to create.  
 



Spiritual Satanism heals this imbalance. Under Spiritual Satanism, people will reconnect 
both towards the heavens and towards the earth, and mankind will become whole and 
real again.  
 
We are heralds of cure of spirit for humanity. We must preach this and promote this 
proudly, alas in a safe manner amidst the sleeping people. They will not be asleep 
forever, for as we too wake up, so will progressively more and more others.  
 
Bring people into the light of knowledge and away from the void of ignorance. 
 
-High Priest Hooded Cobra 666  
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