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Most of the people who write in the occult, demonology, demonolatry, and the 
related, they basically fall into the trap which is common in many people who 
practice magick.  
 
Imagination as a faculty, is necessary, and is the same place from where applied 
imagination becomes into magick. However, the very same faculty when one 
doesn't know the how's and why's of it, becomes the source of delusion, self-
deception, and in other cases, mental paranoia. 
 
In the case of many "Demonologists" and others, they write these huge books 
about how they "Communicate with Demons", and basically they profane any 
form of communication. As such, for centuries now, people come into Satanism 
to seek equal dreaming or profanity.  
 
There are books of over 500 pages where essentially these so called 
"Demonolaters" who believe they are "Gods" themselves (but cannot move a 
toothpick on their desk and are incapable to do the most basic magick, but they 
are Gods, do not ask me how) they are so deeply spiritual and related to the 
"Gods". These "Gods" they also approach through the Qlippoth, which in jewish 
language means the "Husks". The definition of this state is when one basically is 
talking to an empty shell, a creation and fabrication of their own imagination.  
 
In spirituality in general, one is not advanced simply because they believe, or 
even self-deceive, that they are 'advanced'. This is debunked hard by reality. 
Most of these people who write 500 pages books, do not know the actual 
answers to life's most basic questions. They pretend they are affiliated with 
universe governing authorities, but they don't know anything meaningful. This is 
because they are basically falling into a trap that Jung also described in his 
psychology books.  
 
This to simplify it is not "Demonic communication", but rather, imagination. 
Sometimes, some messages from the actual Gods can go through, but the 
untrained mind has a huge 'buffer', which filters and appropriates information. 
That is unavoidable as this is how all living beings are. In other words, 
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information is shaped when it is transferred, or it can come unclear. If drugs, 
selfdeception, and soul issues are involved, the waters become even murkier.  
 
What is characteristic of all these so called 'practitioners' and self-deluded 
people, is that they are not confronted by real problems that require real 
solutions. In other words, in one's little world, one can be a king, unless of 
course, they are confronted with a reality in regards to this very fact. This causes 
in many of these types of people in a sense a collapse. This has happened in 
many cases of arrogant people in the forums.  
 
Any person who is legitimately interested to communicate with the Gods, has to 
make a point to actually advance, actually get rid their soul of shit, actually sit 
down and have some humility, actually sit down and listen. There is no point in a 
sphere that has air in it, and no weight.  
 
Likewise, if one fills their head with thin air, in reality, they will be nothing. Filling 
such a sphere with cement is what is necessary for someone to say they are 
building a spiritual foundation.  
 
It is true that in the beginner levels, imagination, and fruitful imagination, can 
sometimes be necessary. Also, it can really make things happen. One example is 
how in some occult books one is instructed to look at a painting and try to 
communicate with the person they see. Indeed, if this is done many times, it will 
create a situation where one's imagination will take over. This is done for training, 
and not for actual Demonic communication. Demons are superior intelligences 
and one needs to open up their mind, be patient, and learn how to put their 
enthusiasm within context.  
 
Many people also confuse INSPIRATION, GUIDANCE, and DIRECT 
COMMUNICATION.  
 
When you see a beautiful woman, you may be INSPIRED by her. This requires 
no contact. Indeed, she can become a topic in a man's imagination. The fact that 
a woman INSPIRED someone doesn't mean that they are married. People for 
centuries have been inspired by Gods to write music, art, crafts, and create 
beauty. This is past the necessity of direct communication.  
 
The analogy here is one who sees an inspiring woman, and one who is married 
and has kids with her. Of course, the "inspired" can believe, since everything is in 
their mind, that they are with a said woman, or that they are a better father than 
the father of the actual kids of the woman. In one's imagination, one can be 
anything.  
 



Before spirituality was called "spirituality" and parallelized by Hocus Pocus 
infantile things, and was made into Harry Potter style of magick, it was basically 
called "Spiritual Science". This means that it requires delving, perception, and 
serious study and understanding.  
 
The imagination deployed for meditation and that grows out of refining the soul, 
is a higher level soul ability, in contrast to what many have as an imagination, 
which is let's say an ability that 'everyone' has. The good news is that people who 
have very rich imagination, can rectify this, and advance, and become better.  
 
Many of the stories about gnomes, and mermaids, and other things, are created 
to stimulate the imagination, and lead someone to embark into the so called 
'beyond', by stimulating and opening up the sense. From there on, one has to 
advance and evolve this sensation, and master it. This can take decades.  
 
Imagining light and being enlightened is not the same thing. While both things 
come to someone from the same general ability, one is rooted in reality (not as in 
gross physicality, but as in reality of meaning) and another is built in that "It was 
real in my mind" as a jew who tells himself a holocaust happened even if the 
holocaust never happened.  
 
To give you a different perspective here, imagination, is like having a computer 
with an internet connection. You will see a lot of things with it, if you have the 
ability to get in the internet. But you will have to grow wisdom in what information 
'received' is accurate, proper, useful. Eventually, as you become an expert user, 
you will only see things as they are, surf the internet safely, proficiently and with 
your benefit.  
 
Basically, when I was a teenager, I first got a computer with a dial up internet 
connection. I didn't know shit. However, I knew what lied in the so-called internet, 
and I wanted to really find it, see it, impressed by the wonders of the internet. I 
used to put a floppy disk in and out and lock it and I felt like Hackerman. 
Eventually when I got my internet rolling, I didn't know what an anti-virus or any 
of these things were.  
 
So eventually I went on the web and ruined my computer as the first thing I did 
was visit porn sites, the wonders of the imagination, you see. "In my mind it was 
real" hackerman was now there with a broken computer, without knowledge how 
to fix it, it really felt devastating.  
 
If anyone talked to me when I was doing such improper use, I would just shout 
"FUCK YOU! YOU DON'T KNOW SHIT! NOBODY SPEAK TO HACKERMAN, 
OK?" and of course continue in the same course. Who are they to question 



Hackerman? Hackerman knows all. I even knew to lock the floppy disk, and also, 
press Control Alt Delete. I'm God Now, I can't be stopped, after all, if shit hits the 
fan, I press Control Alt Delete and deal with it. What does an IT expert have on 
me? My professor of 10+ years didn't know shit!  
 
Well as you can understand this led to a broken, and later fried computer.  
 
What changed about more than a decade later is that I realized I wasn't 
hackerman by any stretch of the imagination. Indeed, what I also understood is to 
pale or respect the knowledge of those who were really into this craft, or who 
were genius in said craft. Now, ironically, my ideas of being hackerman were 
completely vanished, but my confidence in the so-called computer craft has been 
raised by an inconceivable extent.  
 
Many people think that when sometimes I come to explain these subjects, this is 
to limit. On the contrary, I explain to liberate. One who goes around the internet 
and gets viruses, trojans, and is constantly deceived by fake news websites is 
not a clever internet user. To be on this is also not giving you most out of the 
internet. Also, this can break your computer to smithereens.  
 
The good news is that you can replace or fix a computer, but you can't always do 
the same with the mind. If I was wise to sit down and listened, I would be way 
more ahead, and I wouldn't have wasted around 3-4 months just doing circular 
loops around myself. I would also have spared my first computer.  
 
My impatience in that case, only delayed me.  
 
To give one further example, there are a few types of individuals who are coming 
here frequently and are very vocal about experiences with greys, and so forth 
other maladies. These are not good omens. One has to learn of Establishing 
Control: 
https://www.satanisgod.org/www.angelfire.com/empire/serpentis666/Control.html 
 
 
The person who has mastered a lot of these basics, will not have to deal with a 
lot of problems down the road, as everything builds on a foundation. People who 
do not will find these later on. This is like climbing the mountain and being 
unprepared for water shortages. You can climb as high as you want, but you will 
reach a point where you will not have a water source. You have to be prepared. 
 
If your computer is fucked from you using it improperly, and it gives you pop-up 
windows of shit that you don't wanna see, then you aren't exactly using it right. 
Likewise, the mind which is undisciplined can create numerous problems, from 



minor annoyances to literally destructive things. People get destroyed from a lack 
of control on the mind. This paralleled with the mind can show what it means on 
the mind.  
 
The mind is metaphorically a computer that you cannot afford to fry.  
 
Superstition is not a part of Satanism. Yoga is called the Yogic science. 
Spirituality should also be treated as a serious, divine, and important thing, that 
one takes seriously.  
 
The above people are not in any way the same, anymore than a person cooking 
in their kitchen 2 eggs is the same with Gordon Ramsay, with a home cook who 
just learned to fry 2 eggs. Only in the mind of the random cook is Gordon 
Ramsay somewhere close to them. It is "real in their mind", but when reality is 
concerned, one is in Mars, and the other in the lower basement.  
 
It is therefore imperative for those who want to become Gordon Ramsay's in the 
spiritual pursuits to look at things in a more 'serious' perspective. Treat spirituality 
as if it is something real, and not something fake.  
 
Above all, one has to start cooking. There will be mistakes, there will be failures, 
there will be successes. What is important is for people to KEEP ADVANCING, 
steadily, and forward. This on its own is what will make one on a spiritual level 
and give the ability to further ascend. One must not defend their mistakes and 
failures if they are to improve - the wise man is the man who accepts them and 
moves forward to correction.  
 
The above leads to mastery, liberation, perfection, and above all, true happiness 
in one's self-assurance. 
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[Gear88] wrote:  
 
“At HP Cobra what if in my situation. I've been dedicated nearing my 16th 
anniversary at April 29th of this year, I tried back then as a pre-teen to do it 
on the 30th Beltane but I never knew about the astrological night/day shift 
period. I have noticed some OLD members come back, 2001 even hell I 
was surprised a while back when Hvit Omir stated his 2002 dedication.” 

 



 
It doesn't matter how old of your dedication is. This is not a race to decide who 
will be what and at what time. Spiritual evolution takes time, and requires 
patience. A lot of people are here for 10+ years. Competing is futile. Your only 
measure of development should be overcoming yourself. Other than that, we 
advance as a team, and help one another. 
 


